
WHY	CHOOSE	ATLAS	
GROUP®?

The	Atlas 	Group	plan 	 from	MIS
Group, 	 a 	member 	 of 	 Tokio 	Ma-
rine 	HCC, 	 is 	with 	you 	and	your
group	of	5	or	more	almost	any-
where 	 you 	 may 	 travel 	 in 	 the
world. 	 Atlas 	 Group 	 coverage 	 is
perfect 	 for 	mission 	 trips, 	 large
family	vacations,	student	groups
abroad, 	 corporate 	 groups, 	and
overseas 	 excursions 	 for 	 other
large	organizations.

Traveling 	 internationally 	with 	 a
group 	 for 	 pleasure 	 or 	 business
should	be	a	pleasant	experience.
Emergencies 	 and 	 complications
such	as	natural	disasters,	injury,
or 	 illness 	are 	a 	 fact 	of 	 life, 	 and
can	be	even	tougher	to	manage	if
it	is	for	a	large	group	of	people.
We’re	here	to	help	if	any	of	these
incidents 	 happen 	 during 	 your
trip.	For	your	peace	of	mind,	cov-
erage 	 for 	 medical 	 expenses 	 in
case	of	hospitalization--including
stay	in	an	intensive	care	unit	or
outpatient	treatment,	emergency
medical	evacuation	are	just	some
of	the	beneϐits	from	Atlas	Group.

My	family	has	medical	insurance
in	our	home	country;	do	we	need
group	travel	medical	insurance?

Often,	the	primary	medical	insur-
ance	 in 	your	home	country	will
not 	 cover 	 you 	 and 	 your 	 family
while 	 traveling 	 internationally,
and 	 medical 	 expenses 	 can 	 be
very 	 costly 	 while 	 abroad. 	 Past

clients 	 have 	 encountered 	 over
$68,000	in	medical	expense	from
an 	 emergency 	 medical 	 evacua-
tion	alone.	Atlas	Group	plans,	in
contrast, 	 offer 	 affordable 	 cover-
age—plans	start	at	less	than	$1	a
day!	Additionally,	Atlas	Group	in-
cludes	essentials	such	as	transla-
tion 	 assistance 	 while 	 being
treated, 	doctor 	and 	hospital 	 re-
ferrals, 	and	assistance	replacing
lost	prescriptions.

After 	purchasing 	 coverage, 	 how
can 	 I 	 trust 	 the 	 company 	 to 	 be
there	if	I	need	them?

MIS	Group,	headquartered	in	the
United	States	in	Indianapolis,	In-
diana, 	 is 	a 	 full-service 	company
offering	international	medical	in-
surance 	 designed 	 to 	 meet 	 the
need 	 of 	 consumers 	 worldwide.
Tokio 	 Marine 	 HCC, 	 headquar-
tered 	 in 	 Houston, 	 Texas, 	 con-
ducts	business	in	approximately
180	countries.	Tokio	Marine	HCC
is 	 part 	 of 	 Tokio 	Marine, 	 a 	 pre-
mier	global	company	with	a	mar-
ket	cap	of	approximately	$30	bil-
lion.	Tokio	Marine	HCC	holds	a	ϐi-
nancial	strength	rating	of	AA-	for
Standard	&	Poor’s	and	Fitch	Rat-
ings	and	A൅൅	ሺSuperiorሻ	by	A.M.
Best	Company.

Sports	Coverage

Atlas 	 Group 	 includes 	 coverage
for	eligible	injuries	and	illnesses
that	could	occur	while	participat-
ing 	 in 	 many 	 popular 	 vacation
sports 	 - 	 skiing, 	 snowboarding,
snorkeling, 	 water 	 skiing, 	 and
others 	 – 	 at 	 no 	 additional 	 cost.
Certain 	 extreme 	 sports 	 are 	 ex-
cluded	from	coverage.	

Natural 	 Disaster 	 Beneϐit 	 – 	 Re-
placement	Accommodations

If	a	natural	disaster	occurs	while
on	your	trip,	causing	you	to	be-
come 	 displaced 	 from 	 your 	 ac-

commodations, 	Atlas 	Group	will
provide	relief	of	up	to	$100	a	day
for	5	days	to	help	cover	the	costs
of	alternative	accommodations.

Acute	Onset	of	Pre-Existing		
Conditions
If	you	are	younger	than	70,	you
may	have	limited	covered	for	an
acute	onset	of	a	pre-existing	con-
dition	with	a 	sudden	and	unex-
pected	outbreak	or	recurrence.

Political	Evacuation

If 	the	United	States	government
issues	a	travel	warning	for	your
destination 	 country 	 after 	 your
arrival, 	Atlas 	Travel 	will 	coordi-
nate	your	alternate	departure	ar-
rangements 	 from 	 that 	 country
and	cover	the	associated	costs.

Crisis	Response

$10,000 	 and 	 optionally 	 up 	 to
$100,000	 to 	offset 	 costs 	associ-
ated 	 with 	 kidnapping, 	 such 	 as
ransom, 	 crisis 	 response 	 ex-
penses,	and	loss	of	belongings.

Repatriation	of	Remains

In	the	unfortunate	event	of	your
death	while	traveling	abroad,	At-
las 	 Travel 	will 	 arrange 	 for 	 and
cover 	 the 	 costs 	 associated 	with
the	repatriation	of	your	remains.

Terrorism

In	these	turbulent	times,	the	risk
of	a	terrorist	attack	is	a	reality.	If
you	are	in	the	wrong	place	at	the
wrong 	 time, 	 and 	 the 	 country
you’re 	 visiting 	 is 	 NOT 	 under 	 a
travel 	 advisory, 	 Atlas 	 Travel 	 of-
fers 	 coverage 	 for 	 medical 	 ex-
penses	resulting	from	those	acts.

 24/7 	Worldwide 	 Travel 	 and
Medical	Assistance

 Travel 	 Document 	 and 	 Pre-
scription	Drug	Replacement	

 Emergency 	 Travel 	 Arrange-
ments
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